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VT LEG #351408 v.1 

MEMORANDUM 

To: Joint Fiscal Committee members 

From: Sorsha Anderson, Staff Associate 

Date: December 1, 2020 

Subject: Grant Requests – JFO #3028 

 

Enclosed please find one (1) item, which the Joint Fiscal Office has received from the 

Administration.  

 

JFO #3028 - $90,455.00 to the VT. Department of Motor Vehicles from the Federal Highway 

Association to increase the amount of tax revenue available for highway programs by increasing highway 

use tax compliance efforts with emphasis on motor fuel taxes.  This request does not stem from the state 

or federal response to the COVID-19 pandemic.  

[Note: The grant is part of a multi-state grant for the Northeast Region.  On the Project Agreement [page 

6 of the grant packet] an incorrect amount is noted for the Northeast Region total.  Please see the email 

from the FHWA at the back of the grant packet confirming the correct amount.  The total VT award of 

$90,455.00 is stated correctly throughout the application.] 

[JFO received 011/30/20] 
 

Please review the enclosed materials and notify the Joint Fiscal Office (Sorsha Anderson: 

sanderson@leg.state.vt.us) if you have questions or would like this item held for legislative 

review. Unless we hear from you to the contrary by December 20, 2020, we will assume that you 

agree to consider as final the Governor’s acceptance of this request. 
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Sorsha Anderson

From: LeBlanc, Leonard <Leonard.LeBlanc@vermont.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 5, 2020 11:29 AM

To: Aronowitz, Jason

Cc: Cayia, Lori

Subject: FW: DMV Fuel Tax grant 1548 VT signed form

Please proceed with the AA-1 and included a note about the incorrect amount on the form. Thanks 

 

From: LeBlanc, Leonard  

Sent: Monday, October 05, 2020 11:29 AM 

To: 'Kirby, Patrick (FHWA)' <patrick.kirby@dot.gov>; Carusona, Alicia <Alicia.Carusona@vermont.gov> 

Cc: Blaisdell, Terri <Terri.Blaisdell@vermont.gov>; Kingsbury, Marv <Marv.Kingsbury@vermont.gov>; Bierbaum, Bruce 

<Bruce.Bierbaum@vermont.gov>; Cayia, Lori <Lori.Cayia@vermont.gov>; Hake, Matthew <matthew.hake@dot.gov> 

Subject: RE: DMV Fuel Tax grant 1548 VT signed form 

 

We will proceed with a State of VT grant acceptance process using the form with the incorrect amount and just make a 

note of it. We can get a corrected form later. Thanks 

 

From: Kirby, Patrick (FHWA) <patrick.kirby@dot.gov>  

Sent: Monday, October 05, 2020 11:15 AM 

To: LeBlanc, Leonard <Leonard.LeBlanc@vermont.gov>; Carusona, Alicia <Alicia.Carusona@vermont.gov> 

Cc: Blaisdell, Terri <Terri.Blaisdell@vermont.gov>; Kingsbury, Marv <Marv.Kingsbury@vermont.gov>; Bierbaum, Bruce 

<Bruce.Bierbaum@vermont.gov>; Cayia, Lori <Lori.Cayia@vermont.gov>; Hake, Matthew <matthew.hake@dot.gov> 

Subject: RE: DMV Fuel Tax grant 1548 VT signed form 

 

EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not open attachments or click on links unless you recognize and trust the sender. 

Lenny, 

 

You are correct that the total Project Amount is incorrect based on the original documents sent. Please see attachment. 

That amount should read $1,309,100. This can be corrected now and we will have it ready for when the funds are freed 

upon or we can just wait until the funds are allocated and then just complete another Project Agreement from scratch. 

Your call. Thanks.  

 

 

Patrick Kirby 

Financial Manager 

DOT – FHWA Vermont Division 

802-828-4568 

Patrick.kirby@dot.gov 

 
 

From: LeBlanc, Leonard [mailto:Leonard.LeBlanc@vermont.gov]  

Sent: Friday, October 02, 2020 2:24 PM 
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To: Carusona, Alicia <Alicia.Carusona@vermont.gov>; Kirby, Patrick (FHWA) <patrick.kirby@dot.gov> 

Cc: Blaisdell, Terri <Terri.Blaisdell@vermont.gov>; Kingsbury, Marv <Marv.Kingsbury@vermont.gov>; Bierbaum, Bruce 

<Bruce.Bierbaum@vermont.gov>; Cayia, Lori <Lori.Cayia@vermont.gov>; Hake, Matthew (FHWA) 

<matthew.hake@dot.gov> 

Subject: RE: DMV Fuel Tax grant 1548 VT signed form 

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the Department of Transportation (DOT). Do not click on links or open attachments 

unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 

Hello-  

It was brought to our attention that the amount on this form was incorrect in one place. I initially thought that amount 

referenced the entire multi-state amount but it appears that is not the case. Let me know if you prefer to correct this 

and resubmit. It is the “Total Project Amount” amount that appears to be incorrect.  

 

 

From: LeBlanc, Leonard <Leonard.LeBlanc@vermont.gov>  

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 11:40 AM 

To: Carusona, Alicia <Alicia.Carusona@vermont.gov>; Kirby, Patrick (FHWA) <patrick.kirby@dot.gov> 

Cc: Blaisdell, Terri <Terri.Blaisdell@vermont.gov>; Kingsbury, Marv <Marv.Kingsbury@vermont.gov>; Bierbaum, Bruce 

<Bruce.Bierbaum@vermont.gov>; Cayia, Lori <Lori.Cayia@vermont.gov>; Hake, Matthew <matthew.hake@dot.gov>; 

LeBlanc, Leonard <Leonard.LeBlanc@vermont.gov> 

Subject: DMV Fuel Tax grant 1548 VT signed form 

 

See attached. Thanks 

 

Leonard (Lenny) LeBlanc, Chief Financial Officer 

Vermont Agency of Transportation 

219 North Main St.  

Barre, VT  05641 

802-479-1245 

mailto:leonard.leblanc@vermont.gov 

 


